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Nova plastic casing was established in Godby, Finland, in 1995. The production of plastic
casings was moved to Nuevo Laredo, Mexico, in 2004. It remains fully operational today.

A quote from Rodolfo Torrez - Plant Manager,
Nuevo Laredo
"From the very beginning, the goal of ViskoTeepak Nuevo Laredo has been to be as good as the

world’s top producers of biaxially oriented plastic casing. To reach this goal, we have been granted

the right to buy the best machines and equipment available to the business. Additionally, everyone at

the company is committed to giving his or her input in the development process, the product, and

the systems of quality control and assurance.

Meet Dora Cerda
“I arrived at ViskoTeepak just when the plant
started here in Nuevo Laredo. We were all new
and learned about this new project together.
My first 6 years at the company were spent in
the extrusion area. I then supported the
quality department for some years before
moving to the printing area where I have been
working for 5 years now. I love working here.”
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Meet Maximino Perez
“I joined this great company 11 years ago. I like
to learn from all areas, so that I can provide
support to my colleagues in any way possible. I
am currently in the printing area, and I will
continue learning about the new processes as
they become available.”

Meet Jesus Loya
“I have been with ViskoTeepak for 14 years
now. My first 4 years with the company were
spent in the extrusion area and now I am
currently in the warehouse as a materials
assistant. I hope to continue in this great
company for many more years.”
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